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Share Buybacks: Puts & Takes

A Wild Ride
Following a dramatic selloff in December, the S&P
500 has risen a remarkable ~17% over the past
two and a half months and now sits near its 200-
day moving average. While the market’s 9.4%
YTD increase marks the strongest start to a year
since 1991, thus far it has failed to break through
the psychologically important 2,800 resistance
level. Indeed, this unique V-shape trading pattern
indicates that investor expectations have likely
over-shot on both the upside and downside since
September’s high-water mark. It also suggests
that this volatility is unlikely to subside until a
clearer directional catalyst emerges to support
current market levels.

As corporate management teams evaluate how
best to deploy excess cash, the pursuit of an
‘optimal’ capital allocation model is really a
moving target. In recent years, there has been a
shift towards returning more cash to
shareholders rather than plowing it back into
operations. Peeling back the onion further reveals
that share buybacks are becoming a more
attractive option relative to dividends, which may
be due to the increased flexibility they offer. It’s
important to note that dividends and share
buybacks largely accomplish the same thing—
increasing shareholder returns – whether it be in
the form of a cash payment, or greater per-share
earnings. While most investors welcome this
boost to shorter term returns, some worry that
excessive buybacks may come at the expense of
sacrificing longer term productivity growth.
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E-Sports: Opportunities Abound

Single Stock Risk
Stock market investing inherently comes with
exposure to risk. However, the variability of risk
and return for an individual stock as compared
to that of a more diversified portfolio illustrates
that not all risk is created equal. The total risk
exposure for a given stock has two components:
systematic risk and idiosyncratic risk.
Idiosyncratic risk (also known as stock-specific
risk) is driven by company-specific factors, such
as changes in the end-market demand for a
company’s products, its competitive
environment, or management team. The second
type of risk is systematic risk, which represents
unavoidable 'market risk', i.e. the portion of risk
that cannot be diversified away. Given the
greater long-run predictability afforded by this
latter type of risk, it’s no wonder that economists
refer to diversification as one of the few ‘free
lunches’ out there.

Over the past decade, there has been a
significant rise in the popularity of e-sports, a
form of video game competition typically between
professional video game players and organized
teams. Viewers attend live competitions or watch
via online streaming platforms like YouTube or
Twitch, with the latter being an increasingly
popular form of entertainment for young
Americans. Indeed, e-sports viewership has
already surpassed that of several U.S.
professional sports leagues and is unlikely to
lose momentum anytime soon. According to a
2018 Washington Post poll, 38% of Americans
between 14-to 21-year-olds said they were fans
of e-sports or competitive gaming, while 40% of
those surveyed said they were fans of the NFL.
Based on the substantial mismatch between
viewership and current industry revenue, there
appears to be substantial runway for growth in
the monetization of e-sports content.
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Contact: If you have any questions or comments, please do not hesitate to contact us at 703.992.6164. For more information about Harbour
Capital Advisors, please visit our website at www.harbourcapitaladvisors.com.

Disclosure: Harbour Capital Advisors, LLC (“HCA”) is an SEC-registered investment adviser located in McLean, Virginia. HCA and its

representatives are in compliance with the current filing requirements imposed upon SEC-registered investment advisers by those states in which

HCA maintains clients. HCA may only transact business in those states in which it is registered or qualifies for an exemption or exclusion from

registration requirements. A direct communication by HCA with a prospective client shall be conducted by a representative that is either registered

or qualifies for an exemption or exclusion from registration in the state where the prospective client resides. For information pertaining to the

registration status of HCA, please contact the SEC or the state securities regulators for those states in which HCA maintains a notice filing. A copy of

HCA’s current written disclosure statement discussing HCA’s business operations, services, and fees is available from HCA upon written request.

HCA does not make any representations or warranties as to the accuracy, timeliness, suitability, completeness, or relevance of any information

prepared by any unaffiliated third party and takes no responsibility therefor. All such information is provided solely for convenience purposes only

and all users thereof should be guided accordingly. Past performance may not be indicative of future results. Therefore, there can be no assurance

(and no current or prospective client should assume) that future performance of any specific investment or investment strategy (including the

investments and/or investment strategies recommended or undertaken by HCA) made reference to directly or indirectly by HCA will (i) be suitable or

profitable for a client or prospective client’s investment portfolio or (ii) equal the corresponding indicated historical performance level(s). Different

types of investments involve varying degrees of risk. Historical performance results for investment indices and/or categories generally do not reflect

the deduction of transaction and/or custodial charges, the deduction of an investment management fee, or the impact of taxes, the incurrence of

which would have the effect of decreasing historical performance results. The material contained herein is provided for informational purposes only

and does not constitute an offer to buy or sell or a solicitation of an offer to buy or sell any option or any other security or other financial

instruments. Certain content provided herein may contain a discussion of, and/or provide access to, HCA’s (and those of other investment and non-

investment professionals) positions and/or recommendations as of a specific prior date. Due to various factors, including changing market

conditions, such discussion may no longer be reflective of current position(s) and/or recommendation(s). Moreover, no client or prospective client

should assume that any such discussion serves as the receipt of, or a substitute for, personalized advice from HCA, or from any other investment

professional. HCA is neither an attorney nor an accountant, and no portion of the content provided herein should be interpreted as legal,

accounting, or tax advice. The tax information contained herein is general in nature and is provided for informational purposes only. HCA does not

provide legal, tax, or accounting advice. HCA cannot guarantee that such information is accurate, complete, or timely. Laws of a particular state or

laws which may be applicable to a particular situation may have an impact on the applicability, accuracy, or completeness of such information.

Federal and state laws and regulations are complex and are subject to change. Changes in such laws and regulations may have a material impact

on pre– and/or after–tax investment results. Rankings and/or recognition by unaffiliated rating services and/or publications should not be

construed by a client or prospective client as a guarantee that he/she will experience a certain level of results if HCA is engaged, or continues to be

engaged, to provide investment advisory services, nor should it be construed as a current or past endorsement of HCA by any of its clients. Rankings

published by magazines, and others, generally base their selections exclusively on information prepared and/or submitted by the recognized adviser.


